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102 Hillcrest Heights SW
Airdrie, Alberta

MLS # A2170826

$750,000
Hillcrest

Residential/House

2 Storey

2,273 sq.ft.

3

Double Garage Attached, Insulated

0.10 Acre

Back Yard, Front Yard, Rectangular Lot, Treed

2015 (9 yrs old)

3 full / 1 half

2015 (9 yrs old)

3 full / 1 half

Forced Air, Natural Gas

Carpet, Hardwood

Asphalt Shingle

Finished, Full

Stone, Vinyl Siding

Poured Concrete

Built-in Features, Double Vanity, Granite Counters, High Ceilings, Soaking Tub, Vaulted Ceiling(s), Vinyl Windows, Walk-In Closet(s),
Wired for Data, Wired for Sound
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Exceptional Value! Step into your dream family home, perfectly situated on one of Airdrie's highest elevations and nestled in the desirable
community of Hillcrest.This beautifully maintained home was built by Shane Homes in 2015 and offers 3,158 sq. ft. of total developed
living space. The main floor features a fantastic open-concept layout with 9-foot ceilings, including a great family room with a gas
fireplace, a dining area, and a spacious Gourmet kitchen designed for both functionality and style, boasting an oversized island, granite
countertops, beautiful white cabinets, and stainless steel appliances, including a sleek gas cooktop, wall oven, and built-in microwave.
With ample cupboard space and numerous drawers, this kitchen has everything you need to accommodate all your culinary essentials,
including a large walk-through pantry that connects from the mudroom area to the garage, providing extra storage and convenience. The
main floor also includes a 2-piece bathroom and a private den/office, ideal for a work-from-home setup. Enjoy your favorite music with
built-in speakers throughout the main floor and upstairs. Upstairs, you&rsquo;ll find three spacious bedrooms, two full bathrooms, a
convenient laundry room, and a stunning bonus room that can easily be converted into a fourth bedroom, offering flexibility for your
family's needs. The spacious primary bedroom features a luxurious 5-piece spa-inspired ensuite bathroom, complete with double sinks, a
seated vanity, a relaxing corner soaker tub, 2 large windows, a walk-in shower, and a generous walk-in closet.The second and third
bedrooms are very spacious, each measuring 12 ft x 9 ft. Additionally, there is a 4-piece bathroom & upstairs laundry room for added
convenience. The bonus room is truly one-of-a-kind, featuring vaulted ceilings and a spacious bay window with two large 6 foot windows



that create a cozy seating area, allowing you to fully enjoy the views. Perched on one of the highest points in Airdrie, this home offers
unobstructed views of green space & the mountains, making it the perfect spot to relax and take in the scenery. These windows include
dual blinds with partial and full shade options. The fully finished basement was professionally developed, featuring a large family/rec
room, gym area, and a beautiful full 4-piece bathroom. In-wall wiring for front speakers & subwoofer for the TV. Additionally, a versatile
flex room offers the perfect solution for a second private work-from-home office. The backyard is perfect for kids to play, relax, or for
entertaining guests, featuring a lovely patio deck. This home is located in one of Airdrie's best locations, conveniently close to all
amenities, shopping, CrossIron Mills, the ring road, and much more.This home offers exceptional value, with few comparable properties
on the market at this price point, especially considering its features, size, age & prime location. Shows 10/10! Schedule a viewing today
and experience all this  home has to offer!
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